
     The Federal Reserve’s target range for the federal funds rate is 4.25 % to 4.50 %. 

Futures markets are pricing in two cuts by year-end, while both the President and the 

Treasury Secretary have repeatedly called for lower interest rates—a level of politi-

cal pressure that some argue could blur the line between the Fed’s independence and 

political influence. 

     One of the Fed’s dual mandates is to maintain stable prices. Its preferred inflation 

gauge, the Core Personal Consumption Expenditures (PCE) Price Index, has been 

trending lower, reaching 2.5% year-over-year in April—bringing it closer to the 

Fed’s 2% target. The last time the year-over-year change was lower was in March 

2021, at 2.2%. 

     Although the Consumer Price Index (CPI) covers a narrower assortment of items 

and a smaller percentage of the U.S. population, it also supports the softening trend. 

Core CPI rose 0.13% month-over-month in May and has been gradually declining 

since its peak of 0.80% in April 2021 (see Chart 1). The Treasury Secretary has also 

pointed to the bond market as a signal for lower rates. The two-year Treasury yield, 

currently at 3.96%, suggests that one to two cuts may be warranted. Supporters of 

rate cuts argue that easing inflation data as well as the two-year Treasury yield level 

both support a more accommodative policy stance. 

     However, arguments remain for holding rates steady. One key concern is the in-

flationary effect of tariffs, which could complicate the Fed’s ability to ensure price 

stability. Fed officials have signaled a wait-and-see approach as they assess the po-

tential impact of these trade measures while inflation remains modestly above their 

target. The Fed’s second mandate is maximum employment. The unemployment rate 

held steady at 4.2% in May, unchanged since March 2025. Those favoring keeping 

rates steady may point to a stable labor market and tariff-related uncertainty as rea-

sons to maintain current policy levels for now. 
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Please remember that past performance is no guarantee of future results.  Different types of investments involve varying degrees of risk, and there can be no assurance that the future performance 
of any specific investment, investment strategy, or product (including the investments and/or investment strategies recommended or undertaken by Valicenti Advisory Services, Inc. [“VASI]), or 
any non-investment related content, made reference to directly or indirectly in this commentary will be profitable, equal any corresponding indicated historical performance level(s), be suitable 
for your portfolio or individual situation, or prove successful.  Due to various factors, including changing market conditions and/or applicable laws, the content may no longer be reflective of 
current opinions or positions. Moreover, you should not assume that any discussion or information contained in this commentary serves as the receipt of, or as a substitute for, personalized invest-
ment advice from VASI. No amount of prior experience or success should not be construed that a certain level of results or satisfaction if VASI is engaged, or continues to be engaged, to provide 
investment advisory services. VASI is neither a law firm, nor a certified public accounting firm, and no portion of the commentary content should be construed as legal or accounting advice. A 
copy of the VASI’s current written disclosure Brochure discussing our advisory services and fees continues to remain available upon request or at www.valicenti.com.  Please Remember: If you 
are a VASI client, please contact VASI, in writing, if there are any changes in your personal/financial situation or investment objectives for the purpose of reviewing/evaluating/revising our 
previous recommendations and/or services, or if you would like to impose, add, or to modify any reasonable restrictions to our investment advisory services.  Unless, and until, you notify us, in 
writing, to the contrary, we shall continue to provide services as we do currently. Please Also Remember to advise us if you have not been receiving account statements (at least quarterly) from 
the account custodian. Historical performance results for investment indices, benchmarks, and/or categories have been provided for general informational/comparison purposes only, and general-
ly do not reflect the deduction of transaction and/or custodial charges, the deduction of an investment management fee, nor the impact of taxes, the incurrence of which would have the effect of 
decreasing historical performance results.  It should not be assumed that your VASI account holdings correspond directly to any comparative indices or categories. Please Also Note: (1) perfor-
mance results do not reflect the impact of taxes; (2) comparative benchmarks/indices may be more or less volatile than your VASI accounts; *Please Note: Ranking Limitations. Neither rankings 
nor recognitions by unaffiliated rating services, publications, media, or other organizations,  nor the achievement of any professional designation, certification, degree, or license, membership in 
any professional organization, or any amount of prior experience or success, should be construed by a client or prospective client as a guarantee that the client will experience a certain level of 
results if the investment professional or the  investment professional’s firm is engaged, or continues to be engaged, to provide investment advisory services. A fee was not paid by either the 
investment professional or the investment professional’s firm to receive the ranking. The ranking is based upon specific criteria and methodology (see ranking criteria/methodology). No ranking 
or recognition should be construed as an endorsement by any past or current client of the investment professional or the  investment professional’s firm.  ANY QUESTIONS: VASI’s Chief 
Compliance Officer remains available to address any questions regarding rankings and/or recognitions, including the criteria used for any reflected ranking. 
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